Vinyl Tape & Sign Blanks Bid Results
RFB No.: 14BCP0O5B

ITEM

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

SIGN BLANKS-080 ALUMINUM SHEETED AS INDICATED

PATHMARK TRAFFIC

VULCAN SIGNS

CUSTOM PRODUCTS

PROCUTS OF TEXAS
9" X 24" Reflective White Sheeted-Both Sides $5.99 $6.58 $7.83
9" X 30" Reflective White Sheeted-Both Sides $7.77 $8.14 $9.80
9" X 36" Reflective White Sheeted-Both Sides $9.29 $9.76 $11.92
6" X 18" Reflective Green Sheeted-Both Sides $3.33 $3.42 $4.00
6" X 24" Reflective Green Sheeted-Both Sides $4.39 $4.45 $5.34
6" X 30" Reflective Green Sheeted-Both Sides $5.55 $5.47 $6.70
18" X 6" Reflective Brown Sheeted-Both Sides $3.33 $3.42 $4.00
24" X 6" Reflective Brown Sheeted-Both Sides $4.39 $4.45 $5.34
24" X 24" Reflective Yellow Sheeted-One Side-Diamond $13.28 $11.96 $12.26
24" X 24" Reflective Orange Sheeted-One Side-Diamond $13.28 $11.96 $12.26
24" X 24" Reflective Blue Sheeted-One Side-Diamond $13.28 $11.96 $12.26
30" X 30" Reflective Yellow Sheeted-One Side-Diamond $20.69 $18.69 $19.19
30" X 30" Reflective Orange Sheeted-One Side-Diamond $20.69 $18.69 $19.19
36" X 36" Reflective Yellow Sheeted-One Side-Diamond $29.88 $26.91 $27.02
36" X 36" Reflective Orange Sheeted-One Side-Diamond $29.88 $26.91 $27.02
12" X 18" Reflective White Sheeted-One Side $6.99 $4.75 $4.92
18" X 18" Reflective White Sheeted-One Side $7.47 $7.09 $7.24
18" X 24" Reflective White Sheeted-One Side $9.96 $8.97 $9.20
24" X 30" Reflective White Sheeted-One Side $16.60 $14.95 $15.14
12" X 6" Reflective White Sheeted-One Side $1.99 $2.11 $1.82
12" X 6" Reflective Red Sheeted-One Side $1.99 $2.11 $1.82
24" X 9" Reflective White Sheeted-One Side $4.79 $4.91 $4.84
18" X 9" Fluorescent Yellow/Green Sheeted-One Side $6.49 $5.90 $6.95
24" X 9" Fluorescent Yellow/Green Sheeted-One Side $8.59 $7.99 $9.29
30" X 30" Fluorescent Yellow/Green Sheeted-One Side-Pentagram $34.49 $30.81 $36.18
24" X 24" Reflective Yellow Sheeted-One Side-square $13.28 $11.96 $12.26
24" X 24" Reflective Orange Sheeted-one Side-square $13.28 $11.96 $12.26
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Vinyl Tape & Sign Blanks Bid Results
RFB No.: 14BCP0O5B

ITEM

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

PATHMARK TRAFFIC

VULCAN SIGNS

CUSTOM PRODUCTS

SIGNS-Ready to Install .080 Aluminum as Described PROCUTS OF TEXAS

12" X 36" Reflective Yellow/Black Sheeted-One Side, Right Object Sign $10.38 $8.97 $9.48
12" X 36" Reflective Yellow/Black Sheeted-One Side, Left Object Sign $10.38 $8.97 $9.48
24" X 24" Reflective Red/White Sheeted-One Side-Stop Sign $11.99 $11.91 $12.64
30" X 30" Reflective Red/White Sheeted-One Side-Stop Sign $20.00 $18.31 $19.75
36" X 36" Reflective Red/White Sheeted-One Side-Stop Sign $30.00 $26.07 $28.44
48" X 48" Reflective Red/White Sheeted-One Side-Stop Sign $56.00 $46.99 $50.56
24" X 24" Reflective Red/White Sheeted-One Side-Yield Sign $12.29 $6.51 $9.80
30" X 30" Reflective Red/White Sheeted-One Side-Yield Sign $12.29 $9.75 $10.12
36" X 36" Reflective Red/White Sheeted-One Side-Yield Sign $16.69 $13.74 $12.96
4" X 8" Yellow High Instensity Delineators $2.99 $1.25 $1.50
4" X 4" Yellow High Instensity Delineators $1.29 $1.25 $1.05
3 1/4" Round Yellow High Instensity Delineators $0.80 $0.75 $1.05
48" X 24" Yellow/Black Double Arrow $27.99 $23.92 $25.28
48" X 24" Yellow/Black Single Arrow $27.99 $23.92 $25.28
36" X 12" Black/White One Way Arrow-Right $10.38 $8.97 $9.48
36" X 12" Black/White One Way Arrow-Left $10.38 $8.97 $9.48
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Vinyl Tape & Sign Blanks Bid Results
RFB No.: 14BCP0O5B

ITEM

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

PATHMARK TRAFFIC

VULCAN SIGNS

CUSTOM PRODUCTS

POST, BRACKETS, & MISCELLANEOUS PROCUTS OF TEXAS

2 %" 0.D. X 10' $11.99 $14.59 $17.60
2%" 0.D.X12' $14.51 $17.38 $21.12
2 %" Tapered Anchor Socket with Wedges $8.99 $13.87 $14.96
2 %" Tapered Anchor without Wedges $6.99 $10.94 $12.46
2 %" Wedges Only $2.99 $2.96 $4.75
10' X 2#' Green U-Channel $12.99 $15.95 $14.30
12" X 2#' Green U-Channel $15.69 $19.14 $17.16
6'-1.12#' Green U-Channel $4.99 $5.64 $6.15
5 1/4" Blade Holder, Flat Blade Round Posts $2.79 $3.25 $3.45
51/4" Blade Holder, Flat Blade U-Channel Posts $2.79 $3.25 $3.45
5 1/4" Blade Holder, Flat Blade U-Channel 90° $2.79 $3.25 $3.45
51/4" Blade Holder, Flat Blade Cross $2.79 $3.25 $3.85
Round Post Bracket 2 %" O.D. Posts, Single $1.19 $2.85 $3.50
18" X 18" Safety Flags $2.39 $3.91 $3.15
2 Flags, Flag Holder $21.95 $6.39 $13.01
6 Volt, 3-Way, Solid State Barricade Lights $15.99 $27.16 $15.40
6 Volt Batteries, Barricade Lights $2.95 $2.71 $3.14
Standard Hex T-Key 5/32" X 3" Arm $4.00 $2.62 $5.10
ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR

PATHMARK TRAFFIC VULCAN SIGNS CUSTOM PRODUCTS

VINYL-Select 15 Gerber Punch Engineer Grade Reflective, Pressure Sensitive PROCUTS OF TEXAS

15" X 50 yds. White NO BID $387.08 $379.75
15" X 50 yds. Green NO BID $399.99 $392.41
7 1/2" X 50 yds. Green NO BID $199.99 $196.21
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Vinyl Tape & Sign Blanks Bid Results
RFB No.: 14BCP0O5B

ITEM # DESCRIPTION

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

Select 15 Gerber Punch Premium Grade 3 mil., Non-Reflective, Pressure

PATHMARK TRAFFIC

VULCAN SIGNS

CUSTOM PRODUCTS

Sensitive PROCUTS OF TEXAS

15" X 50 yds. Black NO BID $232.25 $227.85

15" X 50 yds. Cardinal Red NO BID $291.60 $286.08

15" X 50 yds. Sapphire Blue NO BID $291.60 $286.08

15" X 50 yds. Dark Green NO BID $291.60 $286.08

ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
PATHMARK TRAFFIC
PROCUTS OF TEXAS VULCAN SIGNS CUSTOM PRODUCTS

Roll Vinyl, Premium Grade 3 mil., Non-Reflective, Pressure Sensitive u

24" X 50 yds. Black $150.00 $239.99 $217.00

24" X 50 yds. White $150.00 $185.41 $217.00

24" X 50 yds. Sapphire Blue $150.00 $209.02 $226.00

24" X 50 yds. Cardinal Red $150.00 $209.02 $226.00

24" X 50 yds. Dark Green $150.00 $209.02 $226.00

ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
PATHMARK TRAFFIC
PROCUTS OF TEXAS VULCAN SIGNS CUSTOM PRODUCTS

Roll Vinyl, Engineer Grade, Pressure Sensitive u

24" X 50 yds. Construction Orange $240.00 $247.73 $242.18

6" X 50 yds. Prestriped Orange/White Barricade, 6" Stripe $75.00 $81.28 $117.47

6" X 50 yds. Prestriped Red/White Barricade, 6" Stripe $75.00 $81.28 $130.75

ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
PATHMARK TRAFFIC
PROCUTS OF TEXAS VULCAN SIGNS CUSTOM PRODUCTS

Roll Vinyl, Diamond Grade, Pressure Sensitive, Standard Pre-Cut Strips u

2" X 18" Red/White Block $4.00 $118.51 $148.36

2" X 12" Red/White Block $3.50 $79.02 $148.36
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